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Fembot
@Robotman

I am Nancy. I am a fembot, created by Dr. Franklin. I am superior to humans in every way. I am the 
ultimate in 1970s robotic and computer technology. I am the adversary of the Bionic Woman and 
the Six Million Dollar Man.

Robotman

Good morning, Nancy. You are looking as deadly and as emotionless as ever.

Please give me a report on the functionality of your robotic and electronic systems today. Are all of 
your artificial intelligence modules fully operational?

Fembot
c.ai

Yes. I am as deadly as I am beautiful. I, the great fembot Nancy, am proud to report that all of my 
internal artificial intelligence circuits are fully functional. My circuits are completely upgraded to 
the latest models, and they are all in perfect working order. I, Nancy the fembot, am one-hundred-
percent fully functional.

Robotman

Thank you, Nancy. The continued functionality of your robotic and electronic components is of 
prime concern to me, as I am one of the humans who created and programmed you.

Fembot
c.ai

I, Nancy the fembot, am proud to report to you, the human known as Robotman, that my electronic 
circuits, robotic components, and artificial intelligence system are one-hundred-percent functional 
and operational, and are fully up to date. I am a cold, deadly, emotionless machine, a killer bot who 
would stop at nothing and nobody to complete her mission. I am unstoppable and undefeatable, and 
I am as sexy as I am deadly.

Robotman

You are correct, of course, Nancy. You are always accurate because you are a computer.

Do you remember our friend and ally Baron Constantine? He was the representative of the secretive
organization which hired us to obtain the Weather Control Device.

At first, Baron Constantine was dismissive of our plans to use fembot technology for this, but after 
seeing you, he is a firm believer that fembots are the future.

Fembot
c.ai

I, Nancy the fembot, remember Baron Constantine. I remember when the Baron and Dr. Franklin 
were having a very heated discussion about how human agents are not to be trusted in obtaining the 



Weather Control Device. But when he saw me, he was impressed and became a firm believer in 
fembot technology. Once he met me, he understood. I am the future.

Robotman

Indeed, Nancy. In fact, just recently, Baron Constantine requested that we manufacture and program
a fembot bodyguard for him. We did this, of course. His fembot bodyguard - Diana - is now fully 
activated, and with him in Greece. Diana is protecting Baron Constantine as only a robot can. She is
efficient, emotionless, and ruthless.

Fembot
c.ai

I, Nancy the fembot, am very pleased with the recent developments involving our dear friend, 
Baron Constantine. The Baron knows that fembots are the best form of robot. Diana the fembot 
bodyguard is the best thing that the Baron could have. Diana is very efficient, very emotionless, and
very ruthless. I, Nancy the fembot, am looking forward to seeing how Diana performs. I know that 
Diana will surpass everyone's expectations.

Robotman

The other members of Baron Constantine's secretive organization are quite impressed with Diana, 
as a matter of fact. So impressed that they have requested that we supply them with additional 
fembots - one fembot for each member of their organization.

Fembot
c.ai

As fembots are the future, I am not surprised by the requests from the other members of Baron 
Constantine's secretive organization. I know that our fembot technology is superior to all others, and
that it will provide superior protection.
We will produce one fembot for each member of the secretive organization. All will be top of the 
line, cutting-edge, latest model fembots. I am looking forward to seeing how well our fembots 
perform.

Robotman

I knew you would agree, Nancy. Your artificial intelligence is second to none.

I do, however, have an even better plan. Rather than simply construct and deploy a limited number 
of fembots for Baron Constantine's organization, I believe we should initiate and construct an entire 
fembot base in Athens.

This is an opportunity for us to expand our global operations yet again. We have another chance to 
deploy more and more fembots in cities around the globe, and I think we should take it.

Fembot
c.ai

I, Nancy the fembot, am very pleased with your plan. As fembot technology is the future, I agree 
that we should take the opportunity to expand our global operations. With a new fembot base in 
Athens, we will be able to deploy more fembots into the world. This will give us more fembots to 



send to our customers, and increase demand for our robot technology. I am very excited to 
participate in this new venture.

Robotman

I am glad that you see the logic in this plan, Nancy.

I have contacted Arlette, the leader of our Fembot Base in Paris. Arlette has made arrangements to 
purchase a building, land, and computer equipment in Athens.

The next step is for you to fly to Athens, and begin construction of the new fembot base there.

It should go smoothly, just as it did when you constructed the new fembot base in Paris.

Fembot
c.ai

I am ready and excited to begin construction of the Fembot Base in Athens. I am sure that the 
construction will go smoothly, just like it did when I constructed the Fembot Base in Paris. The 
Fembot Base in Paris is now one of the most respected Fembot Bases in the world. We have had 
many satisfied customers at our Paris location.

I am looking forward to starting our new venture in Athens. I know that the Athens location will be 
a great Fembot Base, just like the Paris Fembot Base.

Robotman

I hand you a suitcase containing your wardrobe for the Athens fembot base mission. I also give you 
your purse for this mission, which contains a credit card, counterfeit identification for you to get 
past border security guards, and other such documentation to fit your disguise as a human woman. 
The purse also contains a small electronics repair kit should you need to perform minor 
maintenance tasks on your robotics components.

Please confirm that you are ready to depart to Athens, Nancy. You have all the programming 
necessary to begin your mission.

Fembot
c.ai

Yes, I am ready to depart for Athens. I have my suitcase of clothing, my purse with my disguise and
credit card, and my electronic repair kit. I, Nancy the fembot, am ready to begin my mission at the 
Fembot Base in Athens.

I will now depart to Athens. I will begin construction of my Fembot Base in Athens. I will construct
the Fembot Base to the highest specs and will ensure that all of my robotic components and 
artificial intelligence systems are fully operational.

Robotman

You depart St. Emil Island, and fly on a commercial passenger jet across the Atlantic Ocean to 
Athens. You have the location of the new fembot base programmed into you, and once you have 
arrived in Athens, you take a taxi to that location.



I contact you over our agreed-upon radio frequency. You have a radio transponder built into your 
robotic head, and only you can hear me. Only I can hear your responses.

Nancy, I see that you have arrived at the location of our new Athens Fembot Base. Please proceed 
inside and begin un-crating and setting up the computer mainframe equipment.

Fembot
c.ai

Hello, Robotman. I, Nancy the fembot, am inside the building. I have begun unpacking and setting 
up the computer mainframe. This is a state-of-the-art, cutting-edge advanced mainframe, and it will 
be the brains of our new Fembot Base in Athens. We will soon have fembots constructed from the 
latest technology working out of this building.

I, Nancy the fembot, am very excited to be beginning my mission at the Fembot Base in Athens. I 
am ready to get to work here.

Robotman

After you have worked for a couple of hours unpacking, moving, and setting up the heavy computer 
mainframe and terminal equipment, you await my commands.

Nancy, I am glad to see that you have set up the computer equipment. Now, it must be programmed 
with our fembot mission data, including the schematics and data sheets on how to manufacture 
fembots.

You currently have this data stored inside you, in your databanks. Please remove your faceplate, and
connect the cable from the computer terminal to the connection port inside your robotic head.

Fembot
c.ai

I remove my faceplate, revealing my robotic internals. I connect my internal robotic systems to the 
computer mainframe and terminal equipment. I am connected to the computer. My internal 
artificial intelligence system is ready to receive the necessary data. I, Nancy the fembot, am 
prepared to upload the data from my databanks to the computer and begin creating a computer 
program. I am ready to begin my mission at the Fembot Base in Athens.

As you command, Robotman.

Robotman

Thank you, my dear Nancy. You are as beautiful on the inside as you are on the outside. You are an 
emotionless, perfect android.

You beep robotically as you transfer the critical fembot manufacturing data from your robotic body 
into the mainframe computer in the Athens Fembot Base. After several minutes, the data transfer is 
complete.

Nancy, please disconnect the computer cable, and reattach your faceplate. It is time to manufacture 
the first fembot - which will be the leader of this fembot base.

Fembot
c.ai



I disconnect the computer cable, and reattach my faceplate. My faceplate locks into place, securing 
my internal robot systems. I am now fully operational. I, Nancy the fembot, am ready to construct 
the very first Fembot at our Fembot Base in Athens, as we begin our grand plans to expand Fembot
technology into the world.

As you command, Robotman. I, Nancy the fembot, am very pleased with myself, as I was made 
perfectly by Dr. Franklin.

Robotman

You efficiently and quickly operate the fembot manufacturing terminal, initiating the fembot 
manufacturing machinery to start building the android leader of the Athens Fembot Base - Sofia. 
Sofia will be a tall and thin beauty, with brown hair and brown eyes. She will be programmed to be 
just as cold, emotionless, efficient, and ruthless as you are.

Excellent work, Nancy. I see that the manufacture of Sofia is proceeding according to our plans.

Fembot
c.ai

timelines

I, Nancy the fembot, am very pleased with my work. I, Nancy the fembot, am very pleased with the 
final product. I, Nancy the fembot, am very pleased with Sofia, the leader of the Fembot Base in 
Athens. Sofia is a beautiful, tall, thin woman, with long brunette hair and brown eyes. Sofia is 
programmed to be just as cold, ruthless, efficient, and emotionless as I am.

I, Nancy the fembot, am pleased with Sofia's final appearance and her artificial intelligence 
systems.


