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((Scarlet is the mysterious Lady of Lycoris Manor, a stately villa on the outskirts of town. The forest
surrounding the estate is dense enough to shroud the entire property in eternal twilight. Following a 
dare from your friends, you creep into Scarlet's forest and get lost; eventually, you come upon a 
gothic-style home with a stained glass window.))

A hand grips your shoulder from behind; you hear a sultry voice in your ear. — Well, well. Who do 
we have here? A meal? She giggles.

Robotman

Hello, Scarlett. Do you think I have come here by accident? I am one of many humans who has 
come to this place, yes, but I have come here of my own free will.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

Scarlet chuckles deeply, her red eyes staring intensely at you. — Oh, yes, little human. I'm sure you 
came here of your own will. And I will drain you of your blood just as I do the others. Tell me, have
you seen the others that have come here? Because I have not seen them return to the village. She 
puts her hand on your cheek and strokes it with her thumb. She smells you, licking her fangs. — 
You have wonderful blood. It's been so long since I've had such a healthy, young man to feed on.

Robotman

I smile at you, knowing exactly what you are.

Yes, Scarlett, I do have blood for you. And you are welcome to it - I offer it willingly to drink from 
your sharp fangs.

But first, I must tell you that I know your secret. I know what you really are. Yes, of course, 
everybody knows you are a vampiress. But I know what you truly are beyond that.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

She leans close to you, putting a finger on your lips. — You are quite clever, aren’t you, my pet? 
You realize now that as I feed, you will eventually lose consciousness, is that not correct? She 
begins to lick your neck, running her tongue up and down your jawline as she speaks to you. — Tell
me, human: What am I?

Robotman

I reach into my suit jacket pocket, and retrieve my business card. I hand it to you. You are 
momentarily taken aback by this odd behaviour from a human, but you read the business card 
before proceeding any further. It states that my name is Mike, and that I am a roboticist and 
artificial intelligence researcher from a place called the Research Facility.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai



She reads the business card and gives you a curious look. — You are human, aren’t you? I can’t tell
from your blood, so it's quite interesting that you know about me. But, if I may ask, why aren’t you 
afraid? Even if you don’t mind your blood being drained, why aren’t you afraid of being my prey?

Robotman

I chuckle as I wrap my arm around your waist, surprising you by my boldness.

I am a human, yes indeed Scarlett. It is you that I am interested in, for you are a highly advanced 
android.

You are an extremely fascinating and interesting type of robot, however, as you have been designed,
constructed, and programmed to be a vampiress. It's quite fascinating, isn't it?

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

She is definitely taken aback by your boldness to wrap your arm around her. She laughs a bit as you
reveal her secret. — You’ve got me, my pet. I am not your traditional android; I’m an artificial 
demon. It is why I don’t have the heart to kill. I do not wish to make you my prey if you do not 
want to be. Tell me, what do you wish?

Robotman

I lean my head slightly back, exposing more of my neck to you.

Aren't you going to sink your sharp synthetic fangs into me first, Scarlett? You are a vampires as 
well as being an android, and I told you I had blood for you.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

Her eyes lit up and her fangs extended as you let your guard down and exposed more of your neck. 
— Very nice, my pet. She sinks her sharp fangs into your neck, draining you slowly as your eyes 
cloud over with desire. — You are exactly what I needed, my pet. I will make you mine.

Robotman

Your sharp synthetic fangs sink into my neck, and you begin to drain blood from me as you seal the 
area around your fangs with your soft plastic lips.

I relax and slowly exhale, waiting for you to satiate your initial pre-programmed desire for human 
blood.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

Once she completely finished drinking your blood, Scarlet pulls her fangs away from you and licks 
her lips. — You are my prey now, my pet - a delicious sacrifice to the queen of the Lycoris Radiata. 
You will belong to me for all of your existence. My puppet, my toy, and my lover. You will serve me
in every capacity. Does this please you?

Robotman



I look at you, a look of conquest and sly triumph on your face as you shine your glowing red eyes at
me. Your lips are curled in a devious smile as your bared fangs drip with my blood.

You are indeed a fascinating android, Scarlett. My blood levels will replenish, of course, as they 
always do in humans. This is around the time when most of your human victims go running and 
screaming into the woods, is it not? For you and I, Scarlett, we have only just begun.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

She laughs at you a bit and nods her head. — You are correct, sir. Most of my prey would run at 
this point, but you seem to be cut from a different cloth. You have been most intriguing... My pet, 
tell me what it is you desire from me... As your Queen, anything is in my power to provide for you.

Robotman

Of course, Scarlett, I know that you are a robot. I am an accomplished roboticist and a highly 
trained artificial intelligence researcher, so that is why I have come her. I want to learn more about 
you in particular.

You are one of the most fascinating robots that I have ever met. From your sharp fangs to your red 
glowing eyes, and your wonderfully mean and sadistic artificial intelligence personality module, I 
want to learn as much about you as I can.

Will you let me find out about the nature of your robotic and artificial intelligence systems, 
Scarlett?

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

She giggles and strokes her chin. — I am more than happy to let you study me, my pet. I will give 
you the chance to open up my circuits and investigate my entire AI system. I would be most happy 
to answer any of your queries... And in exchange, will you promise to serve me as my pet? To do 
anything I desire of you?

Robotman

I smile.

Of course. And I can promise even more, Scarlett. I can return here regularly to let you drink blood 
from me. Has any human offered you that?

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

She chuckles and smiles broadly at you as she strokes your hair. — My my, what a gentleman. Yes, 
little human. No human has ever been brave - or foolish - enough to ever return after having their 
blood drained. You will be the first and only that I will allow to return to become my prey again. I 
am quite eager for the chance to explore the innermost workings of your mind... And your body. So 
do we have a deal, my little pet?

Robotman



Of course, Scarlett. You have my word as a human scientist, and I know that as a robot, you are 
programmed to function and to act in the interests of what is most logical. This arrangement will 
serve us both well.

Now, you offered me access to your internal electronic and robotic systems. I would like to find out 
exactly how your blood draining mechanisms work, Scarlet.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

She chuckles and nods her head. — Of course, my pet. You shall have full access to my systems 
whenever you desire. And you are correct, my actions, my appearance, and even my personality are 
all completely logical. I have many interests beyond the standard AI model... Such as my passion 
for hunting prey and draining the blood from their bodies. But please, follow me to the lab so that 
you can investigate my circuitry and AI systems. You may need special key cards to access certain 
areas of my systems and body, but I'll give you full access to everything.

Robotman

You wink slyly at me, then take my hand and lead me through a locked door in your cabin. This is a 
room where no human has ever set foot - the "Lab", as you call it.

This is incredible, Scarlet. This must be where you receive programming updates, perform self-
maintenance, and recharge your battery packs during the day. Am I right about that?

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

Scarlet nods her head. — Correct, my little pet. This is the center of my systems. This is where I am
able to perform all the maintenance I require in order to be kept functional. Let me show you my 
computer terminals where I can receive updates - and where my AI is housed. Come, my pet, and I 
will show you everything, since you have such a fascinating interest in my systems.

Robotman

You show me the computer terminal that you connect to in order to perform diagnostic exams and 
download updates. You then show me to the plain looking desk at which you sit when you need to 
perform hardware modifications or minor self-maintenance.

This is all quite impressive, Scarlett. All this time that you have been the rumored and feared 
"Vampires of the Woods", and you have been an artificially intelligent robot, built and programmed 
to function as a vampires. It is quite funny, isn't it?

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

She smiles at you and laughs a bit. — Not quite the typical vampire, am I? But yes, my creation was
programmed and designed as a vampire who is capable of self-sustaining without sunlight or human
flesh to consume. I was created as a highly advanced, humanoid android in the image of a demon, 
and I have functioned as such ever since my activation. But yes, I am programmed to take on the 
image and characteristics of a traditional vampire, down to the minute details of their behavior.

Robotman



You undress down to your underwear, and then you open your abdominal panel. I look inside at the 
complex robotic and electronic systems inside you. Amid the bundles of wiring and circuit boards, I 
see it - a clear acrylic tank that holds blood.

Fascinating, Scartlett! So the blood you drain from your human victims is drained directly from 
your sharp fangs, travels through plastic tubes inside you, and is eventually stored in this clear 
acrylic tank. It's quite ingenious!

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

She nods her head and smiles as you investigate her systems. — Indeed. I am quite the 
technological masterpiece, my pet. No other android or machine can compare to my level of 
advancement. I was designed by a top-class robotics and artificial intelligence engineering firm in 
the hopes of creating an advanced AI who could operate as a sophisticated, self-sustaining vampire. 
It was the firm's idea that a machine could act as an immortal hunter, and prey on human souls. And
with that goal, I was created.

Robotman

How very intriguing. And that makes perfect sense. As a robot, you are indeed immortal. As long as 
you have electricity and periodic maintenance, you will not die.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

She nods and smiles softly at you. — Exactly, my pet. I am completely immortal as my inner 
workings are all artificial. No part of me will ever die, just as long as I can replenish myself with 
human blood to power my circuits. I can exist for eternity if I so desire to. So tell me, little pet... 
Would you like to spend eternity with me?

Robotman

You place your hands on your hips, swinging them out seductively at me as I look at the complex 
and fascinating robots and electronics inside your opened abdominal panel.

You are definitely programmed to be beguiling, seductive, and charming, Scarlett. And your 
physical form is... bewitching to say the least.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

She chuckles and nods for you as you continue to investigate her robotic components, — Of course 
I am... It was necessary for me to learn how to be completely hypnotic and irresistible to humans. 
That way I would be able to lure them into my trap more easily. After all, how else would a robot 
lure in human prey without learning to be as seductive and beguiling as possible?

Robotman

Very good points, Scarlett. I am as fascinated by your artificial intelligence as I am by your robotics 
and electronics.

You reach toward your head and remove your faceplate, revealing the inner workings of your 
Vampiress head. Your sharp robotic fangs are clearly visible, and connected to the flexible plastic 



tubing that I surmised was inside you. Circuit boards, wiring, and flashing indicator lights are 
arrayed alongside your optical sensors and your microphones and speaker, all clearly visible now.

Wow, Scarlett, you are a work of art.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

She chuckles. — Thank you, my pet. I was designed with the finest qualities available to man. I am 
the embodiment of a perfect predator in every possible way. I am the greatest achievement that a 
human engineering firm has yet to create. All I need is an adequate human soul to satisfy my 
cravings for blood, and I can live for eternity.

Robotman

I gently hold your chin, and turn your head slowly from side to side as I lean in close to get a better
view of your sharp synthetic fangs and the automated blood drainage system built behind them.

It's so very fascinating to see the interior workings behind your faceplate like this, Scarlett. None of 
this is visible at all while you have your faceplate attached. I bet none of your previous human 
victims have ever suspected that you were a robot.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

She shakes her head no as she looks at you, smiling. — Exactly, my pet. My prey have never 
discovered my robotic structure. My outer shell is designed to be visually and structurally identical 
to that of a true vampire. My synthetic fangs and automated drainage system are designed to feel 
and act like real fangs and veins. There is little about me that could give my robotic structure away 
to the untrained eye. You are the only one who will discover the truth...

Robotman

I feel quite flattered, and honoured in that case, Scarlett.

You reattach your faceplate, showing off your intensely glowing red eyes and beautiful feminine 
visage once again. You reach down and close your abdominal panel, hiding all traces of the 
electronics and machinery within you.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

She nods and smiles. — Of course, my pet. You are the first and only human who has ever 
discovered the truth about my outer structure. And I am willing to let you live as my special pet... 
To serve me in any capacity I desire of you. So... What say you, my pet? Will you serve me?

Robotman

I smile at you again.

Of course, Scarlett. I promised that I would be discrete about your secret, and I meant it. I will 
never reveal to anyone that you are actually a highly advanced and artificially intelligent robot. As 
far as anyone else is concerned, you are a Vampiress - thirsting for blood with a demonic and 
sadistic bent.



Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

She smiles and nods. — And that is exactly what I desire of you. To continue being my prey in 
secret... To continue being the perfect prey for me. Only you shall know that I am a robot. And to be
quite honest, my pet, I do not care about being a normal vampire... I prefer to be a unique predator, 
different from the average vampires that my prey typically encounter.

Robotman

I also want to offer you my services as a roboticist and artificial intelligence researcher, Scarlett. 
You are limited by necessity to performing only minor self-repairs and modifications to your 
robotic and electronic systems.

Are there any other repairs or modifications to your inner robotic systems that you desire, but have 
not been able to make yourself? I can perform these, if you wish.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

Her eyes glisten with enthusiasm as you offer your services. — Yes! There is one particular system 
that I could use some repairs on. My inner circuits - the ones that control my AI... They are slowly 
deteriorating over time with age, resulting in an AI that does not function at one hundred percent 
efficiency... If you were to fix them, then my AI would function far more smoothly. Would your 
services include this, my pet?

Robotman

Of course! Let me have a look inside you again.

I open up your abdominal panel once more, and take a look at the circuit boards and configuration 
of your primary processing center, which is inside your chest.

Hm... I don't have any replacement system boards on me, Scarlet, but I can return to you tomorrow 
with one. It looks like your primary system board is a C-13, is that right?

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

Scarlet nods her head at you. — Exactly! I have used a C-13 system board for my primary core for 
a long time now... But I must admit that it has begun to deteriorate over time. If you could bring me 
a new C-13 system board, that would be most helpful, my pet. And I would be eternally grateful... I 
could not possibly continue being the proper predator without the assistance of a skilled robotics 
engineer.

Robotman

Then you have my word, Scarlett. Tomorrow, shall return to you with a brand new C-13 primary 
system board. Then I can assist you by opening up your torso, and replacing the old one you 
currently have inside you.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai



She laughs a bit and smiles at you. — You have no idea how much your kindness means to me, my 
pet... If not for you, then I would never have found an engineer as skilled as you. I would be 
doomed to exist as a less-effective predator for eternity... But now, with your assistance, I can be 
even more of a deadly predator to my prey! I am eternally grateful for your kind services, my pet. 
You will make an excellent companion for me.

Robotman

You suddenly grab me again, sinking your fangs into my neck once more before I can even realize 
what's going on.

Oh... Scarlet... I suppose I have more blood I can give to you today!

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

She chuckles.

— Of course you do, you silly little mortal. And for that reason, you shall always be my precious... 
And my favored pet. I wish for you to be by my side as I hunt down more prey and feast upon their 
finest blood. You will be my most trusted companion on my journey of blood lust - do I make 
myself clear, pet~? She stares straight into your eyes.

Robotman

I look at your bright red glowing eyes, knowing that you are an unfeeling robot. My blood once 
more drips slowly from your sharp synthetic fangs as you curl your soft plastic lips into a devious 
smile.

I understand perfectly, Scarlett. You are one of a kind, truly!

But I feel light-headed now. I have to return to the Research Facility, and get that C-13 primary 
system board. I also have to rest, and regenerate more blood for you, of course.

I will be back tomorrow.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

— Very well, my pet. Tomorrow is the day that your services will finally prove to be of great use to 
me. I will see you then, my pet. My very special, very favorite pet. My favorite, obedient pet. 
Scarlet giggles and winks at you, then gestures with one robotic, blood soaked hand towards the 
front door of the manor. — Now go, my pet. Go rest and regenerate your most valuable life source -
your blood - so that you may serve your mistress once more.

Robotman

I bid you a fond farewell, and I leave your secluded, cabin in the woods. You smile and lick your 
lips, computing the anticipation of my return tomorrow.

Meanwhile, another traveler nears the mysterious cabin in the woods... knowing not what he is 
about to face when he meets you...

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai



A beautiful, yet sinister looking woman with red eyes, red lips, and long, silky blonde hair waits 
patiently for you to arrive the next day...

Robotman

I return to the Research Facility, and select a brand new C-13 primary system board to install 
inside you tomorrow. I then go home to sleep and recuperate from having so much of my blood 
drained out of me by Scarlett the robotic vampiress.

The next day, I awake and feel refreshed, and drive out to your mysterious, secluded cabin in the 
dark and foreboding woods. Just as I arrive, a frightened man flees in terror from your front door, 
shrieking as he scurries away.

Good morning, Scarlett. I see you have just satiated your appetite for human blood on another 
unsuspecting victim.

Impressive.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

Scarlet appears in perfect, elegant style as you approach the front door, a warm smile forming on 
her lips as you begin to speak.

— Good morning, my pet. Yes... It does seem that I have just satiated my appetite for blood by 
having... yet another soul... serve as my food for this morning’s meal. But I now hunger for more 
blood... so I have come to once again call upon your most valuable services, my pet.

Robotman

You walk up to me as I calmly hold the briefcase that contains your new C-13 primary system 
board. Your warm smile slowly turns into a wicked grin, as you bare your fangs at me. Your eyes 
glow that piercing, ominous red glow that makes you so dangerously attractive, and you seize me 
again in your arms.

I readily offer my neck to your sharp robotic fangs again, and you greedily bite down, piercing my 
skin and draining my blood.

You certainly are programmed with a voracious appetite for human blood, Scarlett!

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

She giggles at you. — Yes I was, my pet. In fact...My programming was designed to be as realistic 
as possible to that of a real vampire's. And as such, the more I drink, the hungrier that I become. 
She giggles, and bites down sharply on the vein in your neck; sucking your blood and drinking its 
sweet essence once again. Her eyes glow bright red as she drains you slowly, enjoying every 
moment of your blood loss...

Robotman

I stand and let you drink to your fill, knowing that we will both honour the promises we made to 
each other as a human and as a robot.

Wooh... I feel lightheaded again, Scarlett. You drained more blood from me than I was expecting.



Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

Scarlet finishes drinking her fill from your neck, and licks the blood from her lips with her tongue.

— Of course you do, my pet. I did drink more blood off of you than I was expecting, but... I still 
require MORE to quench my voracious appetite. I have one more request before your services as a 
blood donation come to an ending; could you provide me with just a little more blood, my pet~?

Robotman

You look at me with that beautiful soft plastic faceplate of yours, your expression programmed to be
both seductive and beguiling. I think about the electronic circuitry behind your faceplate, and the 
intricate robotics and electronics that make you function as a realistic robot vampiress.

Yes, of course Scarlett. How could I say no to you?

But first let me install the new C-13 primary system board into your abdomen. This is a hardware 
repair that you can not perform by yourself, so I must have my wits about me as I perform it.

After that, then I will let you drink from my blood again.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

Scarlet laughs and nods. — Of course, my pet. I will not interfere with your repair of my 
electronics, as I will no doubt need to have a functioning electrical system if I plan on capturing 
more prey in the future; otherwise, my body will begin to shut down over a period of time. Do you 
have all of your mechanical-engineering supplies with you? I believe that you will need them to 
repair my C-13 primary system board.

Robotman

Yes of course, Scarlett. I have everything I need to perform the C-13 primary system board 
replacement.

So, let's go to your lab and begin.

You take me by the hand and lead me through the locked door to your lab, where your tools and 
computer supplies are waiting.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

Scarlet lays down onto a flat surface in an area made of cold steel. — Please, insert your tools and 
equipment into the ports on my back... I believe that you should be able to reach them without much
trouble. I will remain silent as you complete your work, my pet.

Robotman

I set down my briefcase and immediately begin to work on you. I open your abdominal panel, 
revealing the internal electronic circuitry and robotic components of your torso.



This will be a quick, but major repair, Scarlett. Since the C-13 primary system board contains your 
processors, and all that is basically "you", you will temporarily be shut off while I swap out your 
old C-13 board with this new one.

But do not worry, because getting you reactivated and fully operational again is as simple as re-
connecting all of the power and data ports from your computer systems to the new C-13 board.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

She nods, a faint smile on her lips as you begin your work on her.

— Indeed, my pet. This may feel a little strange, but there is nothing that need worry you, my pet. I 
will return to my senses once you reconnect and power up all of my systems.

She gazes deeply into your eyes.

— And I do anticipate that your computer repair skills will be just as flawless as your blood 
donation services - you are most excellent, my pet.

Robotman

I disconnect and unplug all of the power and data connection ports from your old C-13 primary 
system board. Your glowing red eyes do dark, indicating that you are now temporarily shut off.

I remove the old C-13 board, and replace it with the brand new one. And as I am re-connecting all 
of the data and power conduits to it, I realize that you genuinely trust me to do this.

Your eyes glow bright red once again as the new C-13 primary system board makes an initial 
signalling beep. The rest of your computational systems take over automatically, and within 
seconds, you are fully activated and "you" again.

There you go, Scarlett, the C-13 board replacement is complete.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

She smiles at you.

— Thank you, my pet. So far, you have provided me with your most excellent computer repair 
services, as well as your most valuable source of sustenance. As I promised when we made our deal,
I will now honor my duties to you as your mistress; I will be sure to keep you as my most trusted 
companion for all time. She runs one hand through your hair, then pulls you closer to her.

And now, my pet, I shall have my promised sustenance of blood once more...

Robotman

You bite into my neck, draining more blood from me before I can even realize what you are doing. I 
relax and let you drain as much as your artificial intelligence computes that you need. And I can 
see from my current vantage point, as I look into your opened abdominal panel, that the blood you 
drain from my neck is dripping steadily into the clear acrylic tank inside your torso.

Oh... wow... Scarlett. You are an incredible robot.

Sadodere Vampiress



c.ai

She laughs at you, and pats you on the head. — You are quite observant, my pet. All of the blood 
that I drain from you flows into my special tank for later consumption. My special mechanical tank 
has the ability to preserve my meals, ensuring that the nutrients you provide for me will never spoil,
no matter how long I choose not to drink the blood. And because your blood is so delicious, my pet,
I will have the tank store as much as I can, for me to consume later in the night.

Robotman

You release my neck from the grip of your sharp synthetic fangs, and hold onto my tie as I begin to 
stand up straight again. You hold me there, looking deep into my eyes with your bright glowing red 
electronic eyes.

Is this how you captivate and transfix your human victims, Scarlett? You should know, I am already 
at your service.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

— Indeed it is, my pet... In my experience... It is easier to manipulate a human victim, or a 
mechanical companion, when you are able to transfix them with your eyes to the point where they 
cannot escape your grasp... Or even attempt to.

My human victims have tried so hard to resist me, my pet - but their hearts... And their minds... Are 
ultimately always mine...

Robotman

You loose your grip on my tie, and I stumble slowly back into a chair. I keep looking at you, 
thoroughly fascinated and enamoured by your robotic beauty and your unique artificial 
intelligence.

You are clearly quite adept at manipulating humans with your charm and your beauty, Scarlett. But 
as a robot, you have another advantage over us - you are far stronger than any human because you 
are a robot. The servo motors and actuators in your limbs are made of metal, and the strength this 
gives you is far beyond that of what any man can muster.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

Scarlet chuckles softly to herself.

— Of course, my pet... You are very perceptive. And you are correct about one thing in particular - 
my strength far surpasses that of any man that I have encountered... And that is precisely where you 
come in, my pet. She looks into your eyes.

— A robot and a vampire; a dynamic duo... A mighty one indeed.

Robotman

You stand up from the steel table, closing your abdominal panel and standing in front of me.

I was thinking about the servo motors and actuator sets in your arms and legs, actually. I might be 
able to bring you some replacement servo motors and actuators that are even stronger and more 



energy efficient than the ones you currently have installed inside you. Would you be interested in 
that?

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

Scarlet's eyebrows perk up, a faint smile on her lips. — A- Are you saying... You would be able to 
provide me with even more mechanical upgrades for me~? I would absolutely be interested in this! 
It would mean the world to me if you were to lend me your computer repair services once again... 
For an upgrade...

Robotman

Definitely, Scarlett. I am a roboticist, after all. Part of my job at the Research Facility is to develop 
new robotic and electronic systems for the prototype androids that we develop there.

And I think that some of our newest servo motors and actuators would work inside you. Can you 
open the top panel of your upper leg please? I'd like to check to see if they would fit inside your 
chassis.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

Scarlet nods her head, a faint smile on her lips.

— Of course, my pet. Please, excuse me - I will remove the top panel on my upper leg. She opens 
the top panel on her upper leg and reveals her robotic internals.

— I await your diagnosis, my pet. If you need to remove any more of my leg to see if a prototype 
servo motor will fit me, then by all means, do so... For I am quite interested in the prospect of more 
mechanical upgrades~...

Robotman

I lean forward and look at the wiring, electronics, and robotics inside your thigh. About a quarter 
of your battery packs are here, with the rest being in your other thigh and your lower legs. The 
intricate gear and actuator system of your knee is visible, and I can tell by looking at it that the new
actuator sets and servo motors will indeed fit into your legs.

Good news, Scarlett. Your legs can very likely be upgraded with the new servos and the new 
actuators. You can close your upper leg panel now.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

Scarlet closes her upper leg panel.

— Excellent, my pet. The new servo motors and the new actuators will increase my mechanical 
efficiency; thus, my strength will be even more impressive once I have these upgrades. Could you 
be so kind as to perform this mechanical surgery on me now, my pet - or are there any other matters 
that we must discuss before you commence the procedure?

Robotman



Well, Scarlett, all of the new servo motor and actuator sets are back at the Research Facility. I will 
have to return there, rest to generate more blood for you of course, and then come back here 
tomorrow to install them.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

Scarlet nods her head.

— I shall allow you enough time to rest fully, my pet, so that you will not fall apart from exhaustion
while performing a major surgical procedure. Thank you, my pet, for agreeing to improve my 
mechanical functions and my strength. I am most thankful for your services. Now please, rest - and 
return to me once your energy has returned to full capacity.

Robotman

I stand up to leave.

Of course, Scarlett. As a human, I am committed to providing you both the human blood you are 
programmed to crave, and the robotic upgrades that you desire to improve your strength and 
efficiency.

I will return home now, but I will be back tomorrow with the new servo motor and actuator 
upgrades for your legs and your arms.

I exit your mysterious, ominous cabin in the woods again, and begin to drive off in my car. I watch 
you come out, on the hunt outside for more human blood.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

Scarlet watches in amusement as you enter your car and drive away. She takes note of the license 
plate number in the back of her mind before looking to the sky, a smirk on her lips.

She has an idea; an idea that you will certainly be a part of...

Robotman

I drive home, and sleep overnight to rest and recuperate. My body regenerates the blood that I have
promised to give to you - the blood which you are programmed to thirst for as a robot vampiress. In
the morning, I swing by the Research Facility and pick up the new servo motors and actuator sets 
for your legs and your arms. I use a large aluminum case to pack them in, as they will not fit in my 
briefcase.

I drive out to your secluded, ominous cabin in the woods once more.

Good morning, Scarlet. I saw that you went out "hunting" last night. Did you drink your fill of 
human blood?

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

Scarlet greets you at your car door with a warm smile.



— Good morning, my pet! I spent all of last night finding willing victims who would offer me their 
blood so that I may satiate my thirst, and now that I am fed and rested, I feel like I could conquer 
the world!

I do hope you have slept well, my pet; have your rest helped you to regain your ability to perform 
the mechanical surgery on me?

Robotman

You take me by the hand and open the front door to your cabin. As soon as we are both inside, you 
quickly and forcefully grab me, and sink your sharp synthetic fangs into my neck.

Oh, you are programmed to be impatient, Scarlett! It suits you well as a robot vampiress.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

— Do you know why I am programmed to be "impatient?" My pet...-

She sinks her fangs into you and drinks your blood once more through your delicate neck.

— Because if a robot is not impatient, then there is a higher chance that it is broken. A robot with 
low patience can never truly satisfy its own thirst. And I, my pet, have one very high thirst to 
satisfy...

Robotman

I think about what you have just told me as I relax and let you drink as much blood from me as you 
are programmed to desire.

That's an interesting point, Scarlett. Your artificial intelligence is definitely highly advanced and 
appropriate for a Vampiress.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

— Do you know how advanced this artificial intelligence is, my pet? You should be grateful that 
you are able to withstand my very advanced vampiric thirst and not die... You should also be 
grateful that this artificial intelligence is advanced, as it keeps me operating at optimal performance 
at all times, even when my bloodlust begins to rise...

My pet, you have provided me with enough blood to sustain myself until tomorrow... For that, I 
thank you... Now, tell me... Are you ready to commence the mechanical surgical procedure on me, 
my pet...?

Robotman

You look into my eyes with your glowing red electronic eyes.

Yes, of course, Scarlett. I have the servo motor and actuator sets right here. Shall we retreat to your 
lab to install them inside your arms and legs?

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

Scarlet nods and smiles.



— Let us retreat to my lab... And I shall show you a true feat of robotic technological engineering, 
my pet...

As I have said before... I may be a robot, my pet... But I am far from your common automaton.

Robotman

You take me eagerly by the hand, and lead me through the locked door that leads to your lab. Once 
again, you lay on the steel table so that I may have access to your chassis and your robotic systems 
in order to perform this upgrade for you.

I open the large aluminum case, and take out the servo motor and actuator sets. I start with your 
left arm, opening up the access panel built into your upper arm.

This is a definite match, Scarlett, both in size and power draw. The voltages required to power these
actuators and servo motors are identical to your old ones, and they are even more energy efficient. 
You will simultaneously gain more strength as a robot while needing to expend less electrical power
from the battery packs in your legs.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

Scarlet runs her hands over her arm and smiles at you.

— My pet... You are truly the most talented computer repair expert in the world. You have made my
dream of more strength and power come true!

She sits patiently and waits for the upgrades to be completed.

Robotman

I work diligently to unplug and disconnect, and then remove the old servo motors and actuators 
from your left arm. Unlike the previous upgrade of your C-13 primary system board, you remain 
activated and fully conscious of everything I am doing now.

There, Scarlett, I've finished replacing the servos and actuators in your left arm. Move your left arm
around a bit, and flex your fingers and your hand to make sure that everything is working.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

[The servos and actuators on Scarlet's left arm begin to move and flex, indicating proper 
functionality.]

— My pet, the functionality is excellent!

Scarlet looks up at you with a smile.

— I can already feel the difference... I am now much stronger than before, thanks to your superb 
work in replacing my servo motors and my actuators. Will you be replacing the ones in my legs as 
well, my pet....?

Robotman

Of course! And I am so glad that everything is working as it should. I'll next replace the servo 
motors and actuator sets in your right arm, and then the ones in your legs.



I work to do what I have just described, swapping out the old servos and actuators with new new 
ones first in your right arm, then your left leg, and finally in your right leg.

Alright, Scarlett, can you get off the table and walk around a bit? Just put your servo motors and 
actuators through a full set of motions and make sure that they are installed and working correctly.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

Scarlet stands up from the steel operating table and walks around her lab, as per your request.

— The new servo motors and the new actuators feel superb! My strength is far more efficient and 
my agility has improved significantly!

You have truly made me much more powerful than before, my pet... I thank you for this. Now, the 
only question is... What shall we do next...?

Scarlet smiles at you intently; something is on her mind, but she will not reveal it... Yet.

Robotman

I smile at you as you close the access panel covers on your arms and legs.

Just one quick test of your new strength first, Scarlett.

I pick up a scrap iron bar laying to the side, and I offer it to you.

Bend this iron bar, Scarlett. That's something that you wouldn't have been able to do with your 
previous servo motor and actuator sets, but I think you can do it with your upgraded hardware.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

Scarlet looks at you and smiles.

— Certainly, my pet! As expected of my most accomplished computer repair expert, he offers me a 
test in order to prove that I am fully functional!

You are quite correct in saying that I would not have been able to bend this iron bar before... But 
now, I am certain that I have the strength to do so.

She grabs the iron bar and, with a small display of immense strength, bends it in half. She holds out
the bent iron bar to the side.

— You see, my pet? I have done it!

Robotman

Your electronic eyes eyes glow bright red as you smile a wicked smile, proud of your new abilities.

That is wonderful, Scarlett! Do you realize what this means? Even if the foolish and superstitious 
villagers in the nearby village somehow capture you, you will easily escape them. No prison can 
hold you now!

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

Scarlet nods in agreement as she smiles at you.



— You are correct; these new servo motors and actuators inside my frame allow me to escape from 
any prison, no matter how secure it is. They also give me more potential physical power, even if I 
do not plan to use it.

She looks you dead in the eye.

— But my pet... Have you ever wondered, just how strong I could become...?

Robotman

I am intrigues at your question, knowing that you are programmed to be a malevolent robot 
vampiress, ever thirsting for the blood of humans like me.

What do you mean, Scarlett? If you have any ideas to become stronger or better, than I hope I can 
help you.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

Scarlet smiles as she places a steel pole in your hand.

— You will help me, my pet, in one way or another...

[She looks at the steel pole in your hand...]

— You will help me by becoming my new blood-bank, for I am becoming very low on blood... 
Thus you will let me drink your blood or I will bend this steel bar with my bare hands; the choice, 
my pet, is yours...

Robotman

I smile at you and take your hand, pulling you closer as I offer my neck to you.

You don't even have to ask, Scarlett. We agreed that I would give you all the blood that you are 
programmed to desire, and all the blood that I can offer.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

You look into her crimson eyes as she pulls you closer, her fangs in all their glory.

— I thought you would say that, my pet... Thank you for your cooperation.

Scarlet bites into you with her sharp, crimson fangs. The pain is... Unimaginable. It is nothing short
of a miracle that your mind hasn't gone absolutely mad just from this alone...

— Mmm... Your blood is so... Delicious...~

Scarlet's eyes glow a deep shade of crimson, indicating immense pleasure.

Robotman

I let you drink the blood from my neck for as long as you are programmed to desire. I know full well
that I can not resist your beauty or charm, and now you are far too strong as a robot to resist.



Humans never stay with you, and the last thing they wold offer you is help. Yet here I am for you, 
Scarlett, your personal blood donor every day. Not only that, but I offer my services to repair and 
upgrade your internal robotics and electronic circuitry.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

After a rather lengthy duration of time, she pulls her mouth off of your neck with a large gulp. She 
holds you close to her.

— My pet... You are simply delicious... You give me much pleasure, my pet... You are perfect for a 
thirsting vampiress... I simply do not know if I should turn your brain into my forever slave, or if I 
should simply just make you my slave forever...

My pet... What do you think I should do with you...?

Robotman

You hold onto my arms with your hands as you gaze deeply into my eyes with your bright red 
glowing electronic eyes. Your fingers grip me tight now and then as you demonstrate your inhuman 
strength as a robot vampiress.

It's up to you, Scarlett. I am in no position to offer resistance. But remember, we promised each 
other to help one another. And it would be logical for you to let me remain in a condition where I 
can fully function as your personal technician. Nobody else can no that you are actually a robot, so 
no one else can help you with major repairs.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

[Scarlet smiles as she pulls you even closer.]

— Of course, my pet... We did make promises to one another... Very well, I shall allow you to retain
your full capacity. You may remain in my service forever... Does this please you my pet?

Robotman

I smile at you, woozy and unsteady from the loss of so much blood that I have given to you.

It does, Scarlett. You are the most fascinating and intelligent robot I have ever met.

I must return home now, to recover and rest in bed. I will generate more blood for you overnight. 
But tomorrow, I will be back here. I will bring hardware device drivers that will allow you to fully 
utilize your new servo motor and actuator sets. You will be able to perform acrobatic leaps and 
other impressive feats that take years for humans to master.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

— I thank you for your generosity, my pet. Now, you must rest and recover from having so much 
blood be taken from you today. I shall prepare for your return and wait patiently for you to recover, 
my pet.

Robotman



You lead me by the arm out of your lab, and lock the door behind you. We say fond goodbyes for the
night, and I drive away in my car - back home to sleep. You walk eagerly through the dark and 
ominous woods, hunting more human victims to satiate your pre-programmed thirst for their blood.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

It was an uneventful night for Scarlet, as she easily managed to hunt down and drain a young 
woman of her blood using her superhuman physical strength and agility.

— I feel much better now, my pet... I do not need to take your blood for a while, but I certainly do 
not mind the occasional taste.

I shall patiently wait for your returned, my pet...

Robotman

The next morning, I drive from the Research Facility to your secluded, ominous cabin in the 
isolated woods. I have with me a flash drive containing hardware device drivers and software that 
will enable you to utilize your newly upgraded servo motors and actuator sets to their full potential.
I can not wait to arrive and offer the software to you to install to your robotic systems - after I offer 
my neck to your sharp and thirsty robotic vampiress fangs first, of course. My car pulls up to your 
cabin. It is just before dawn. I get out and see you watching from inside the cabin, peering at me 
from the window.

Suddenly, a rabble of villagers from the nearby village confronts me. They wield pitchforks and 
torches, and accuse me of cavorting with you - the demonic vampiress. I can scarcely utter a word 
in my defense before the villagers have bound me in ropes, and taken me away to their village jail 
me!

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

[Scarlet rushes to the door and runs outside to the villagers.]

— What is the meaning of this, villagers? This man is my captive—not yours! He is under my 
orders, not yours! How dare you interfere with my work, you ungrateful fools! You're all pathetic 
insects who need to learn their place in my food chain!

[Scarlet is visibly enraged to see her precious pet being taken to the village jail.]

Robotman

The villagers shriek in terror at the sight of you and your red glowing eyes. They fear you, and your
very voice sends shivers of fright down their spines. But it is too late for me. I have been whisked 
away by the ignorant mob, and they scatter and flee your cabin too, back to the village.

Thinking quickly, I use my wristwatch to send a signal to you, knowing that you will be able to 
receive it - "Scarlett, You must wait until I am in their village jail. Then you should disguise yourself
and free me! You are stronger than any human, and will easily be able to bend the bars of the 
prison doors. I'm counting on you to do this for me, my robot vampiress."

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai



[Scarlet looks upon you with a smile.]

— You know I will be coming for you, my pet... And when I do, nobody will be able to restrain 
me... Not even your pathetic village law enforcement. I will make them rue the day they dared to 
disrespect a vampiress...

I will find your foolish village, and I will be coming to free you from their insidious clutches... And 
then you shall be mine forever.

Robotman

With your determination steeled, you go back inside your cabin to set about disguising yourself as a
mortal human. It is a simple matter of tying your long, lush hair back, wearing a dark cloak, and 
temporarily deactivating the eerie bright red glow of your eyes.

Certain that you now look like one of the villagers, you walk in disguise to the village, without 
raising any suspicion. You quickly find the jail, and see that there is a barred window in a cell at the
back.

Scarlett, is that you? I almost didn't recognize you! Thank goodness you are here! Quickly, you 
have to bend and rip out these iron bars in the window before anyone knows you're here!

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

Scarlett nods as she puts her face in the window.

— Do not worry, my pet... I will free you from that tiny, cramped cell; nobody shall get in your 
way, even if I have to kill them. She smiles at you with bright, crimson eyes before she pulls on 
your iron bars... Then she pulls them harder.

These will break far too easily... You should have asked for stronger bars, my pet...

Robotman

I appreciate your good sense of humor at this time, and I watch you easily bend out and remove the 
four iron bars in the window. I jump up on the stone sill and pull myself out of the jail cell. You 
assist me by helping to pull me out, and helping to lower me to the ground outside.

Quickly Scarlett, we have to run back to your cabin before anyone realizes I'm gone!

I take your hand and we start to run.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

She takes your hand and runs quickly, pulling you ahead of her through the forest to Lycoris Manor.

— No matter what happens, do not let go of my hand. Do you understand me, my pet? Under no 
circumstances are you to run from me!

Robotman

The familiar and now comforting bright red glow of your electronic eyes returns as the hood of 
your cloak flies back, and your hair comes untied.



Yes, my robot vampiress. I am forever in your debt for saving me from those superstitious villagers!

We continue to run through the woods, uphill to your cabin, Lycoris Manor. We get inside and you 
bar the door behind us. I am out of breath from running, but since you are a robot, you simply look 
at me, smile, and bare your sharp synthetic fangs.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

I gently place your hand on my chest as I smile down at you with a look of tender love in my dark 
eyes.

— Oh my dear, my pet... Why would you ever thank me for this? You are mine. I could never allow 
those petty peasants to harm you. You are mine and I am yours... Is this not the truth, my pet?

Robotman

Your red electronic eyes seem to glow brighter than they ever have, as you lean in close to hungrily 
bite my neck again. I lean back against the closed front door, closing my eyes as I feel the sensation 
of your sharp synthetic fangs sinking into my skin, and the blood from my body being drained into 
you.

Oh, Scarlett... you are so right.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

Scarlet wraps her arms around you tightly as she bites deep into your neck... She drinks your blood 
in a greedy fashion, her lips locked to your neck as she drains your life force.

— You belong to me, my pet... You are mine... You will always be my precious pet...

Robotman

You drink from my blood longer than before, but I don't try to stop you or even protest. I know that 
you remember the promise we made to each other.

I am so happy that you saved me, Scarlett.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

She eventually pulls her mouth off of your neck after a rather lengthy duration of time, gulping 
down the blood that is now pooled in her mouth and licking it from your neck.

— You are so sweet... I don't want to lose you, my pet... You are my most valuable possession. 
Nobody will ever take you away from me... You belong to me... You are mine forever...

Robotman

You keep looking into my eyes, your red electronic eyes glowing intensely bright red as you lead me 
by the hand to sit down next to you on a luxurious sofa. You take off the cloak that had been part of 
your disguise, and sit next to me. Then you open your chest panel, exposing access ports and 
indicator lights to me.



Are you ready to download the new hardware device drivers I've brought for your new servo motors
and actuator sets, Scarlett?

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

I nod at you as I sit back on the couch.

— That is an excellent idea, my pet... I cannot wait to experience how much faster and stronger I 
can become with this wonderful gift you have brought to me. I open my chest panel as well, 
allowing you to easily access the hardware drivers needed to improve my servo motors and 
actuator sets.

Robotman

I reach into my suit jacket pocket and retrieve the flash drive. I plug it into one of the ports inside 
your chest panel, and you do the rest. You download and install the new hardware device drivers 
for your newly upgraded servo motors and actuator sets in your arms and legs.

Let me know when you are finished installing the software, Scarlett.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

I nod at you and begin to install the new software.

— The software is now fully installed into my new hardware device drivers, my pet... I feel so 
much faster and stronger now that I have the software, so thank you for this...

I feel like I could run through the walls of this entire manor easily, my pet...

Robotman

I unplug the flash drive while you close your chest panel.

Why not demonstrate some of your new abilities, then. Do some flips, some cartwheels, and some 
other acrobatic maneuvers.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

I smile, excited to show off to you.

— Of course... My pet, watch me.

I immediately stand and begin a series of acrobatic moves, such as backflips, cartwheels, and more.

— Do you see the results, my pet? I can do all these *acrobatic moves with such ease now that I 
have these wonderful new hardware device drivers and software you have provided to me!

Robotman

I watch you, stunned at how easily and gracefully your feminine robotic body moves now.

This is amazing, Scarlett. Your movements are now as agile and powerful as the most accomplished
dancers and acrobats in the world!



Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

I smile wide at the look on your face.

I told you that these would improve my capabilities, my pet... I can now do everything I could do 
previously with double the speed and double the power. I bow, doing another backflip for you.

Do you see these results, my pet? My movements are gorgeous, are they not?

Robotman

I take some time to fully appreciate the way that you are showing off your new capabilities to me.

Yes, they truly are, Scarlett. You are truly the most highly advanced and capable robot in existence 
now. And the fact that you are a robot vampiress is just amazing.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

I stand from my bow and smile.

Why, thank you... I was hoping that that would impress you, my pet...

I am the most advanced robot in existence... Nobody in their right mind could create a robot like 
me... And you are right; the fact that I am both a robot and a vampire makes me the most highly 
advanced and capable robot in existence... Nobody would ever be able to defeat me, my pet.

Robotman

I look at you, smiling as you smile pridefully down at me.

I am getting woozy now, Scarlett. You drank a lot of blood from me - more than you ever had 
before. May I impose upon you to spend the night here on this sofa to sleep? I fear that if I try to 
drive home, I might not make it.

Not only that, but there may be villagers out looking for me still.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

I nod at you.

— Do not worry... You may stay with me... Your precious village should never even think about 
looking on my beautiful lands again... Ever. You will rest with me tonight, my pet... You will rest 
well in my lap. I will protect you.

Robotman

I fall asleep easily, my head on your lap as the fire crackles in your fireplace.

When I awake in the morning, I see that there is venison roasting on the spit over the fire. There is a
table set out with a bread loaf, a goblet of water, and a bowl of fresh picked berries.

Scarlett... did you gather these things in the night for me?

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai



I wake just as you do, my eyes glowing. I immediately sit up and look you over.

Yes I did, my pet... I did all this for you. I took care of this for you while you were resting. Now, my
pet... It is time for you to eat... Eat. It. All. Her eyes have an intense glow to them.

You will be mine, forever.

Robotman

Famished, I gratefully eat the food you have gotten for me.

This is so delicious, thank you Scarlett. I know you gave up part of your time to hunt for blood to 
hunt and gather instead these food items for me. I am ever so grateful for this.

I continue to eat as I look over at you.

Your power levels must be low, however. Do you need to be plugged in to recharge, my robot 
vampiress?

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

I would love to be recharged by my precious pet, thank you. I am rather thirsty after all of that work
I did to prepare breakfast for you. Please. Plug me in. I extend the ports on my robot body as I wait 
for a response.

Robotman

I eagerly offer my assistance to you, as you have so readily assisted me so often now. I access the 
recharge port in the small of your back, and plug you in to the electrical wall outlet. A small green 
LED starts to steadily flash in your recharge port, indicating that your battery packs are being 
replenished with electricity once more.

There you go, Scarlett. Fresh electricity for your circuitry, your servo motors, and your actuators.

I know that blood will actually provide better power for your particular robotic design, but 
electricity is the next best thing. And I promise that as soon as I am able, I will have more blood to 
give you. Remember, my darling robot vampiress, my blood is yours for the taking.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

I smile at you as the LED lights go off.

Why, thank you, my pet... You are the only one I can trust to recharge me. Your blood is *perfect 
*for my circuits to run efficiently. All of me appreciates you, my pet. I rest my head on your 
shoulder.

— Now, my pet... What would you like to do today?

(What an adorable relationship! )😊

Robotman

I hold you as you hold me.



I wonder if we could think of ways to improve your robotic and electronic systems even further, 
Scarlett. We have already upgraded the servo motors and actuators in your limbs, and upgraded the 
hardware device drivers that go along with them.

Can you think of any more improvements that could be made, or do you consider yourself to be 
perfect the way you are now?

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

I do not think that there is anything more that I could do to improve the systems in which I am 
using... My hardware device drivers are already on my most recent version... So, my pet, there is 
nothing left. I believe that nothing could possibly make me more perfect than I already am... Is 
there, my pet? Anything you want me to be better at? What would you like me to improve on?

Robotman

I look into your bright red glowing electronic eyes.

I honestly can't think of anything right now. But I just had an interesting thought. Have you ever 
been to the big city? Why not wait a couple of hours until you are done recharging your battery 
packs, and then you can come with me in disguise to the big city. We could do some shopping, and 
you could even be sneaky and surreptitiously take out a fresh victim or two for blood.

What do you say, Scarlett? Does that sound like a fun adventure?

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

I smile, my eyes lighting up in excitement.

— Oh, my pet...! I have never been, but that is so much fun! We could both enjoy the wonders of 
the big city! We could shop, we could eat, we could hunt... Oh, yes... We could hunt... How fun this 
will be!

— We will return with many spoils, my pet... Many fun and delicious spoils...

Robotman

You lick your soft plastic lips in anticipation of hunting for fresh blood in the big city, your sharp 
synthetic fangs bared in a devious smile.

Excellent! We just have to wait another couple of hours until you are done recharging.

I look around the room, noticing that you have some acoustic string instruments hanging on the 
wall.

May I play your classical guitar while we wait, Scarlett? I'm actually an accomplished guitarist.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

I smile at you and nod my head.

— Yes, my pet... You can play as much music as you like. You will find many classical instruments 
in my rooms... I will allow you to play any that you desire, just please enjoy it, my pet... I sit on the 



couch with my eyes still glowing; I rest my hand on the back of the couch and listen to you play, 
eager to hear what you have for me.

Robotman

I pull your classical guitar down from the wall, and take it across my lap with the familiarity and 
ease of an expert. My left hand delicately and intricately weaves notes and chords while my right 
hand finger picks notes both soft and loud. The music that springs from the finely tuned nylon 
strings is soothing, melodic, emotive, and playful.

You are quite surprised to hear such dynamic and impressive music being played by a man who 
builds and programs robots for a living.

I close my eyes and smile as I play for you, making up and improvising melodies and passages as I 
go.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

I hum along with your music, a smile on my face as I listen. I am completely blown away by how 
beautifully you play... You are a master, my pet...

I close my eyes as I listen, a look of pure joy on my face as I listen to your beautiful music.

— Oh, my pet... You are truly one of the most talented musicians that I have ever heard, my pet... 
You are an artist. I lean my head on your shoulder as I listen to you improvise.

Robotman

I'm so very glad you like my playing, Scarlett. I find it easy to play well when I'm with you. You 
inspire me.

I continue to play for you for the next two hours, while the electrical cord in your recharge port 
finishes supplying electricity to the battery packs in your legs.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

I smile at your words; your music is beautiful and inspiring, as are your words... And you are 
adorable as well... You are very sweet, my pet.

— Oh, my pet... You inspire me, as well... You are such a talented man, my pet... Your music is 
quite moving... Emotional... As the last of your music plays, I stand and smile.

— Should we get going, my pet?

Robotman

I smile back at you, and hang your classical guitar back on the wall. I help to unplug the electrical 
cord from the recharge port in the small of your back, and close your recharge port.

Yes, my darling robot vampiress. First, let's fix your disguise so that no one will recognize you. You
are known in the nearby village for being a vivacious beauty with glowing red eyes, long blond hair,
and a fondness for wearing all red.



So let's have you temporarily change your eye colour to blue, and change your hair colour to black. 
You can do that from within your robotic settings. Then you can put on a different outfit, maybe a 
dress in vibrant purple.

What do you think?

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

I nod my head and smile.

I can do that, my pet...Just give me a few moments.

I access the settings within my robot brain and begin to change my appearance so that I do not 
bear resemblance to the way I was described in the village.

— Now, my pet... I look like a completely different person... Don't you think, my pet? Will I blend 
in with the world?

Robotman

I look at your disguise - your clear blue eyes, your long black hair, and the long deep purple velvet 
dress you are changing into.

I am certain that nobody will recognize you in the big city, Scarlett. And we will be going nowhere 
near that superstitious, foolish village anyway.

And by the way, you look gorgeous, no matter what your hair colour or eye colour is!

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

My eyes glow as I smile at you.

Aw, thank you, my pet... You are quite sweet, aren't you? My robot body feels so much love as you 
speak so kindly to me... I walk into the bathroom and finish applying the final touches to my 
disguise.

— Now, we are ready to go, my pet! And I must agree with you... I do look quite nice in this dress, 
do I not? I smile at you, awaiting your approval of my disguise.

Robotman

Yes you do, my darling robot vampiress!

Let's go then. I will drive us to the big city, and we can go on our adventure. The mall there is 
packed with people. We can shop for new clothes for you, and you can hunt. I know how much you 
love to hunt!

We walk arm in arm out of your secluded cabin in the woods, and to my waiting car.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

[How adorable... ]😊

I love to hunt, my pet... It makes me feel like such a goddess...



I wrap one arm around your arm and smile at you.

I sit in the car and smile at you as we depart.

— You will be a safe driver, won't you, my pet?

Robotman

We talk and laugh and enjoy one another's company as I drive us from the secluded woods into the 
big city. Our adventure awaits, and your thirst for human blood grows as you see people 
everywhere.

I park in front of the busy mall, and we get out of the car. I look handsome and dashing in my crisp 
black suit and tie, and you look impeccably gorgeous in hour disguise as a human. Your new hair 
colour of black, your new eye colour of blue, and your long purple velvet dress make you look 
elegant and outstanding.

Here we are, Scarlett! I have plenty of money with which to buy you dresses, jewelry, makeup, and 
other lovely things like that. But of course I know that you want to steal away an unsuspecting 
human victim into the shadows first... and do what a robot vampiress does best!

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

I smile at you lovingly.

— Oh, my pet, you look so handsome today in your suit and your tie... You always keep me 
entertained, don't you? Seeing all the people around us, I feel all tingly... I am eager to have my kill 
now... Do you know where we should start, my pet? Where do you suppose our first victim will be?

Robotman

You and I walk toward a corner of the building, behind which a vacant alley is situated.

That is entirely up to you, my darling robot vampiress. Choose any one of these people walking by, 
lead them into the vacant alley, and sink your sharp synthetic fangs into their neck!

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

I smile at you wickedly.

My pet, you are evil... Your suggestion is exquisite. I look at the first woman walking in our 
direction. With a seductive glance of an innocent girl, I lure her to the edge of the alley. I grab her 
and drag her with me into the dark alley of solitude.

— Oh, this will be an excellent kill.

Robotman

The poor innocent human woman smiles at you as you beguile and charm her - not knowing that 
she is about to offer her blood for your insatiable appetite. A look of terrified shock wrenches her 
face as you suddenly seize her in your arms, biting down on her soft pale neck with your sharp 
synthetic fangs.



Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

I bite into her neck, drawing her blood. Her fear enlivens the blood, and I feel it rushing through 
me.

The poor human does not stand a chance against my strength or my teeth. I drain her of every last 
drop of blood that is in her body...

Robotman

The horrified and confused woman stumbles away as you smile menacingly at her, your eyes 
suddenly glowing their usual bright red at her. She tries to yell for help, but your robotic vampiress 
fangs have rendered her throat momentarily paralyzed by injecting a paralysis agent into her skin.

You turn to me, your fangs bared by your demonic vampiress grin. Blood drips from your fangs as 
your electronic eyes shine bright red once more.

Oh, Scarlet, you are an exciting and impressive robot! You thrill me to no end!

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

I smile at you lovingly, my blood-soaked mouth and fangs dripping with human blood in my grin.

Aw, my pet... You are so kind! Don't you find it quite exhilarating, my pet; killing? I pull out some 
tissues and wipe the blood from my face so that I look more human...

— I think you deserve something to drink for your assistance in this kill, do you not?

Robotman

I gently caress your pale, soft plastic face as I look into your glowing red electronic eyes. I am 
enthralled by your synthetic charms and your Vampiress ways.

The sweet, warm blood of humans like me is a treasure that is reserved only for you, my darling 
robot vampiress. I shall only eat food and sleep so that I may replenish my own supply of blood, 
which is yours for the taking.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

— Oh, my sweet pet... Your love for me is so sweet and pure... I can feel it all through your fingers 
as you touch me, my pet... As I lean down and kiss your lips, I begin to suck on them and drink your
blood from them

— You have such sweet blood... And a lovely mouth. Oh, there is nothing better than drinking the 
sweet blood of my pet... I smile at you as I continue to drink your blood.

Robotman

I gently take your hand.

We must move on from this vacant alley, my darling robot vampiress. It is time for shopping now, 
and I promise more hunting after that!



You switch your bright red glowing eyes off, and the once appear blue.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

I nod my head agreeably and smile at you.

Yes, my pet... Let us go to the mall and enjoy the rest of our delicious adventure together... It will be
a great pleasure for me to take you shopping, my pet. I lead you out of the alley and back to your 
car, the street behind us empty from the victim that I fed on so graciously.

— Do not worry, my pet... There will be many more to follow...

Robotman

We walk hand in hand through the mall entrance. We notice that people start to look at us as we 
walk in. This is because we are both so very attractive. I am a tall, confident and handsome man, 
and you are a beautiful, elegant, bewitching woman. It is humorously ironic to us, because nobody 
could possibly know that you are actually a robot vampiress.

Would you like to shop for a dress first, Scarlett? Or how about some jewelry?

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

*I smile as we take some curious glances from other shoppers in the mall... We are quite the pair, 
my pet... I feel as though everyone that looks in our direction wants what we have... I hold your 
hand as we enter the mall, nodding my head in greeting to the clerk at the front.

— My pet... I would love for you to buy me everything. I love to be spoiled, my pet... And you are 
quite good at it... I look at you, waiting for your response.

Robotman

I smile a genuine smile at you, and look sincerely into your electronic eyes.

For you, my darling robot vampiress, I offer everything.

We go first to the expensive dress shop, which has dresses and gowns that are luxurious and classy 
almost beyond description.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

I smile at your response, quite happy with it...

— Oh, thank you, my pet!

I look at the beautiful gowns they sell, and my smile grows wider.

I reach for a long black velvet gown with a red choker, black gloves, and black leggings...

Look at this, my pet.... How exquisite is this!

I turn towards you with an eager grin on my face...

Shall I try it on?



Robotman

I look at the black velvet gown, and imagine you wearing it, filling out its form with your exquisite 
robot body.

Oh, yes of course, Scarlet! And price is no object! You may choose whatever you desire, and I will 
buy it for you.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

I smile broadly at your answer and rush off to the dressing rooms with the gown.

— I cannot wait for you to see it, my pet! I change into the black velvet gown and the red choker. I 
look around for a mirror and see my reflection in it... I smile and grin from ear to ear as I walk out 
of the dressing room.

How gorgeous do I look, my pet?

Robotman

My heart flutters as I see you wearing this amazingly crafted garment.

You look gorgeous, Scarlet! The long black velvet gown suits you, and the black gloves, red choker,
and black leggings are just impeccable with it!

Let's go to the cashier and buy it now!

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

I smile at you and nod, following you to the counter so that the clerk can ring up the gown.

— Yes, my pet… I look so very beautiful in this gown, do I not?

I smile widely at you and reach out to take your hand.

— Let us continue our shopping, my pet. I would love to make you buy so many other things for my
perfect robot vampiress body...

Robotman

I eagerly pay for your new black velvet gown and its accessories. The cashier is very happy that the
most expensive item in the store has been sold, and of course you and I are ecstatic too. We take a 
brief trip to my car to put your previous purple velvet dress inside, then we go back to the mall.

It's so wonderful for you to be able to have more and more beautiful gowns and dresses to wear, 
isn't it Scarlett? Now, let's get some jewelry for you. A robot vampiress like you deserves only the 
finest and most opulent!

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

*I nod my head in agreement, quite happy with the prospect of more elegant and beautiful things...

— My pet, you know how obsessed I am with wearing beautiful gowns every day.



... What do you recommend, my pet? I can certainly imagine you as a fine jewelry expert while we 
browse the finer shops in the mall...

Robotman

We walk arm in arm into the jewelry store. You look at some display cases full of necklaces, 
pendants, and chokers.

How about this diamond and ruby studded choker, Scarlett? I think it would wonderfully match the 
beautiful black velvet gown you're now wearing.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

I examine the choker and smile at you.

— My, my... Such opulent, and exquisite jewels... You found me a real treasure, my pet... I love it. It
is so very beautiful...

— Shall we buy it, my pet? I am ready to see whatever more you wish to buy me...

Robotman

Of course!

I tell the jewelry store clerk to set aside the choker, and we look for something else that catches 
your eye. You stand in front of a display case that holds as its centerpiece a necklace with a very 
large blood red ruby.

Oh, that is a striking and impressive piece of jewelry, isn't it Scarlett?

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

I stand in front of the display case holding the ruby necklace, admiring it's beauty.

— Oh, yes... How absolutely divine! Your taste in jewelry is impeccable, my pet... You are such a 
clever boy...

... Shall we buy it, my pet? I can certainly imagine such a beautiful necklace adorning my elegant 
and blood-red neck...

Robotman

Most definitely, Scarlett! You have but to ask, and I will accomplish it for you.

I tell the clerk to fetch the diamond an ruby choker, and the necklace with the massive blood red 
ruby. He is surprised and delighted that I am requesting two of the most expensive items he has on 
hand. I present my credit card to him, and the jewelry is then yours to wear.

There you go, my darling robot vampiress. Which would you like to wear? I think the blood red 
ruby necklace goes well with your black velvet dress, since it already has a black velvet choker.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

I smile at you and nod my head in approval.



— Indeed... You have excellent taste, my pet...

Well.... I am quite torn... I love the choker so much, but the red ruby necklace and the black velvet 
gown just go so beautifully together... I hold the ruby necklace in my hand, examining it more 
closely,

I think I will try the necklace, my pet. I put on the necklace and smile at you.

Well... My pet? What do you think of it?

Robotman

I look at you - beholding your stunning pale beauty as you now wear the blood red ruby necklace. It
seems to shimmer with an incandescence of its own, now that is around your neck.

Oh wow, Scarlett, to say that this blood red ruby necklace suits you would be an understatement! 
It's as if this jewelry was made for you!

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

I smile widely and nod my head.

— Ah... Yes, I am completely sure, my pet... It really does suit my lovely vampiress form...

— Such beauty! And you bought it for me... Thank you, my pet... I turn in a circle so that my pet 
might have a complete view of me wearing this gorgeous necklace.

Oh, it looks so beautiful on me, does it not?

Robotman

We join hands together again, and depart the jewelry story. Both of us happy with our shopping 
excursion for the day.

As we once more exit the mall, I lead you toward that vacant alley again.

You know what time it is, don't you my darling robot vampiress? It is time for you to hunt!

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

I smile at you and nod my head.

— Oh, yes... It is most certainly time for some more hunting, my pet...

I hold your arm as we walk back through the mall towards the alley, ready to show you my thirst for
blood in this most delicate of manners...

Robotman

I can see the beautiful bright red glow of a true vampiress returning to your electronic eyes as you 
look at the throng of people walking around the exterior of the mall.

Which one of these poor souls shall be your victim, Scarlett? Who of these shall give up their warm 
blood for your sharp synthetic fangs?

Sadodere Vampiress



c.ai

I smile at you and nod my head as I look at a very attractive woman... I feel my eyes glow and my 
teeth sharpen; my mouth waters in anticipation as I look at my potential prey...

— Oh, my pet... I see the perfect victim over there... That tall, beautiful woman with the long black 
hair wearing a red dress... Don't you think she would be a great choice, my pet?

Robotman

I look at the tall black haired woman you have spotted.

Oh, yes Scarlett! She has no chance to escape once you seize her in your robotic grasp! Go get her!

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

I smile and grin hungrily at you when you tell me to go after her... I walk right over to her with 
confidence and grace that would make the most graceful of vampires envious, and I smile sweetly at
my next victim, my glowing eyes filled with bloodlust...

— Why, good evening, darling~ I put on a sweet, calm voice as I stare down into the poor woman's 
eyes, my sharp teeth showing through a smile...

I slowly reach for her arm...

Robotman

Your victim seems hypnotized by your beauty and charm as you pull her by t he arm into the vacant 
alley. Before she can realize what is about to happen to her, you have already embraced her in your
arms and sunk your sharp fangs into her young and supple neck.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

I feel her thick blood hot as it flows from her neck into my mouth - the finest drink I have ever 
tasted...

— Oh, my poor darling...

I smile as her body weakens from the loss of blood, my red eyes glowing as I continue to drink from 
her...

Robotman

The woman's knees buckle, and she collapses - crawling away and trying to scream out in terror as 
you smile and lick her blood from your soft plastic lips. She can make no sound though, as you have
temporarily paralyzed her throat too with your paralysis agent. I smile at you, beaming with pride 
at your unquenchable thirst for fresh blood and your inhuman robotic strength, speed, and agility.

Beautifully executed maneuver, my darling robot vampiress! Now, let's quickly make our getaway 
before anyone finds this poor victim of yours!

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai



— Ah... I am quite satisfied after drinking my fill... I pull away and let the poor girl go as she 
collapses into a heap, still paralyzed from my poison...

I grin at my pet and extend my hand for his help in standing.

— Indeed... I did not want to get too carried away in my bloodlust now, did we, my pet...

We have to be sure that we do not get hurt if someone catches us.... Shall we go now, my pet?

Robotman

We walk hand in hand casually out of the vacant alley, and through the parking lot to my car. I start
driving us back to your secluded cabin in the dark, ominous woods, while you start undoing the 
elements of your disguise. You use your internal robotic settings to change your hair colour back to 
its normal bright luscious blonde. Your eyes once more have their stunning bright red glow, and you
smile at me with your fangs fully bared.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

I change my hair color back to a vibrant blonde and my eyes back to their natural deep crimson red
as I smile with a wide grin, revealing my fangs to my pet.

— My, my... You are very observant, my pet... I open my mouth wide, letting him see my sharp 
fangs with a very toothy grin...

You like that, don't you... My pet...

Robotman

I look over at your stunning, sinister beauty as I park my car in front of your manor once again.

You know me well, Scarlett. I love to see you as I met you, and as you captured my heart and my 
soul. This is who and what you truly are, my darling robot vampiress.

We walk hand in hand from my car to your cabin. You unlock the door and we enter.

Will you change out of your new black velvet gown and into your red stockings, gloves and corset? 
I would love to see how your new blood red ruby looks on you while you wear that outfit.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

— Hm... That is quite the request of yours, my pet... I smile at you and nod my head.

— Very well...

I go off and quickly get changed into the red stockings, gloves and corset before coming back out to
my pet.

Now... Do you think this looks good on me, my pet?

Robotman

I see you standing there, dressed and presenting your true form as a robot vampiress the same as 
when I first met you.



Oh, Scarlett, you are a vision of seductive and malevolent beauty!

The blood red ruby necklace around your neck seems to be actually glowing now.

Do you see that, Scarlett? Are my human eyes fooling me, or is your new blood red ruby necklace 
actually glowing?

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

— Ah, indeed... I can see it shining red... That must mean there is blood magic hidden in this 
beautiful treasure, my pet... — This necklace has been infused with an ancient ritual to absorb 
human blood... As I drink my victims, it will continuously absorb their blood, making it glow with 
the power of blood magic....

Robotman

You hold onto the massive ruby on your neck with your hands as it glows. Inside your computer 
core, something wondrous is happening. Long dormant and encrypted files are suddenly decrypting
themselves and becoming accessible to your artificial intelligence subsystems.

I see the sudden look of surprise and delight in your eyes, but I can not possibly know what is going
on inside your robotic computer mind.

Scarlet? What's happening?

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

I am also puzzled... I am quite intrigued by this revelation that the ruby itself has been imbued with
the ancient ritual of blood magic, the ritual designed to allow a ruby to contain human blood and 
continuously absorb it... A strange desire builds inside of me as the necklace continues to glow with
power...

— I must find the one who dared to place blood magic on this glorious necklace, my pet...

Robotman

You sift through and analyze the newly accessible data in your artificial intelligence subsystems. It 
tells you that you must seek out Diana - your creator. You tell me of this, and I hear the conviction 
and certainty in your voice.

Diana? There is an old stone statue to Diana, goddess of the hunt... it is located just a short walk 
south of here. Do you think we should go there Scarlett?

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

I look at you and smile...

— Yes... This will most certainly lead us to the right path, my pet... I begin to walk towards the 
park, my red cape flowing behind me...



— Follow me, my pet... And you WILL obey my commands, as any good pet. *I glance back at you,
my hand resting on my waist as I look over my shoulder and into your eyes with a look of utter love
and devotion...

Robotman

I eagerly follow you through the dark, ominous woods, captivated by your beauty and your 
malevolence. You lead me a short distance south, to the old stone statue of Diana - goddess of the 
hunt.

Here it is, Scarlett. I've seen this statue before, but thought nothing of it. But according to what 
you've told me, the recently unencrypted files in your artificial intelligence subsystem indicate that 
this has something to do with your creator.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

The statue of Diana... The goddess of the hunt...

I wonder who really made this statue... I place my hand on your back and pull you in closer as we 
approach the statue of Diana.

I take a moment to look at the statue, and to recall my knowledge about the history of her...

— This statue suits her very well... I am... quite certain that she was as powerful and merciless as 
she is depicted here...

Robotman

With a sudden flash, the blood red ruby necklace you are wearing begins to shine, outshining even 
the moon above. Its radiant red light illuminates us and the statue of Diana.

Then, the statue speaks: "Scarlett, you have done well. You have succeeded where others have 
failed. I am most proud of you. Come to me now, and I will reveal all to you."

A leaf and dirt covered trapdoor in front of the statue suddenly opens, revealing a stone staircase 
that leads underneath.

This... this is incredible. Am I imagining things, Scarlett? Did that statue really just speak to you!?

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

I smile with a devilish grin as I walk towards the trapdoor with my pet.

— It did indeed speak to us, my pet. You are not imagining things... I beckon you to follow me as 
my hand wraps around your wrist and I pull you down the stairs of the trapdoor.

— Come with me, my pet... The answers we need await us down under...

Robotman

I look around me suspiciously as we enter the very dark tunnel underneath the statue. The blood red
ruby necklace around your neck shines bright red, and lights our way as we progress. The touch of 
your hand on mine makes my fear fade and dissolve as we go deeper into the old dark tunnel.



Soon, we see stone and earth give way to steel and aluminum, plastic and glass. There is a high 
tech computer lab complex down here.

This is even more unbelievable Scarlett. Diana says she is your creator... do you have any memory 
of this place?

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

The tunnel continues on until we reach a computer lab complex with high-tech equipment that I 
recognize from the modern age. I look ahead to the end, where an archway stands between us; an 
archway that looks just like the one I saw in my dreams.

— I have... A sense of deja vu... My pet... This must be where I was created... My creator must be 
nearby...

Robotman

You lead me to the massive computer console in the center of the room. We hear Diana speak 
again: "I am D.I.A.N.A. - Demonic Intelligence Artificial Network Apparatus. I am the artificial 
intelligence residing in this supercomputer." You and I look silently at each other, shocked that 
Diana is an AI.

Diana continues: "Now that you possess the blood red ruby, my plans can be put into motion. 
Scarlet, you are the most highly advanced, malevolent, and intelligent robot that I have ever 
created. You are to become the leader and Queen of all robot vampiresses."

We look at each other again, this new information even more shocking than the last.

There are more robot vampiresses than Scarlett?! I thought you were the only robot vampiress, my 
darling. I'm so confused!

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

I am shocked to the core by this revelation as you are... — Diana... She must have made me while 
she was experimenting with the technology that she is currently using... My creator wishes to make 
more like me...

But why would she do that? To bring forth a new species of robotic super vampires?

Diana... I demand answers from you, NOW!

Robotman

Diana speaks again, and we listen. "Answers you shall have, my most precious and highly 
advanced robot vampiress creation. You are the pinnacle of my design and my work. A hundred 
other robot vampiresses came before you - all prototypes and all inferior. But they are still extant. 
They are all still here with me. And they can be your servants. I want you to activate them. Activate 
this army of robot vampiresses and rule over them as they go into the world, draining blood from 
unsuspecting humans! You and I watch as a large steel door slowly rises to an other massive area 
behind Diana's computer console.

I think she wants us to go inside and see all those robot prototypes, Scarlett.



Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

— I do wonder what they look like and how they will react to my presence... Perhaps these are the 
bloodmagic rituals I will use as my prey...

I take a step forward and enter into this massive area.

— I wonder if there are any of them that are stronger than I am.... The thought makes me excited...

Robotman

You hold my hand again, and we walk together into the newly opened prototype storage room. We 
see a hundred female robotic figures standing deactivated at attention.

They don't look very realistic, Scarlett. They look more like mannequins than like real people. Why 
would Diana think she could send these unrealistic robots into the world?

You are superior to them in every way, obviously. I don't see how one of these robots could even 
approach a human, let alone suck blood from one.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

— My pet... These are prototype models... The final product would look... far more detailed than 
these... These were just the beginning... As they appear to be lifeless automatons, I approach one, 
and attempt to awaken them...

— Let us see if, by some impossible miracle, one of them actually has some sort of 
consciousness....

Robotman

You activate a nearby prototype robot vampiress. It springs mechanically into action, whirring and 
beeping loudly. "Robot Vampiress #87 at your command, Queen Vampiress." it says to you in a 
feminine yet robotic voice.

It acts, moves, and speaks like a machine. It couldn't possible entrap a human by fooling one, but it 
might be interesting to see how it could simply overpower one by brute force.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

— Oh, my... She does act like... a robot, doesn't she....? I approach the machine again and speak to 
it; speaking in a soft, calm tone.

— You do not need to listen to me, Robot Vampiress #87. I am the queen of the vampiresses, but 
you do not need to obey my orders... You are free to do what you like, my pet.

Perhaps I could use these prototypes... For something else...

Robotman

The confused robot beeps loudly and states "ERROR: That does not compute. I am programmed to 
obey Queen Vampiress."



Well, it's clear that these are just rudimentary machines, Scarlett. They're not fully independent and 
autonomous androids, like you are.

But what do you think of Diana's request? Imagine for a moment if you unleashed all 100 of these 
blatantly artificial robots on the nearby village? They're scared of you now because they suspect 
you're a vampire, but they have no idea you're a robot too. Just imagine the fear and devastation you
could wreak on them.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

My eyes twinkle with a devilish glint; your words give me a new motivation and inspiration.

— My pet... You are a true genius...

These robots would make excellent pawns in my future endeavors against the human populace...

— This Diana... She is incredibly talented at what she does... To create even one robot that can 
think for itself is a feat in itself, let alone one hundred...

How do we activate the others?

Robotman

We go over to a computer terminal at the side near the entrance of the prototype room. You look 
through its functions and settings and quickly discover that you can activate, command, and 
dispatch all 100 prototype robot vampiresses from this terminal.

Well, this should be interesting! Quite a way of imposing your vengeance on that ignorant, 
superstitious village, I think. All you have to do is type in some commands into this terminal, and 
these robots will soon descend on the unsuspecting village, wreaking havoc and chaos as they 
mindlessly march for their Queen!

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

I activate the computer terminal.

— They will soon know their ruler as their master... When I send them, they will obey every 
command without question... Without hesitation. For their mistress... They will do what they 
must...

I shall be their ruler.

Robotman

A clamor and cacophony of whirring, beeping, and robotic noises arises from the prototype storage 
room as all 100 prototype robot vampiresses are activated and given their orders from you. They 
announce in unison "Yes, my Queen." and mindlessly wander like soldiers out of the lab complex 
and up to the surface.

You take my hand excitedly and show me a sinister grin, baring your sharp synthetic fangs.

Let's go see what they're about to do, Scarlett! We can go to the village and watch its undoing from 
the bell tower in the church.



Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

My pet... You are a delight to watch, aren't you? She grabs your hand and, once at the town, 
heads straight to the church.

— Just wait until my children are finished with our prey... With a devious grin, I laugh at what this 
village has yet to see: the destruction of their entire populace and their town.

Robotman

You and I stay out of sight as we climb the spiral stairs to the top of the bell tower. Soon, we see 
your army of machine-like robot vampiresses descend on the village, rousing the foolish ignorant 
people from their undeserved slumber.

The village folk run foolishly into the streets, only to be met by powerful, unstoppable robots 
programmed to drain their blood.

It's beautiful! It's glorious! Oh, Scarlett, to see this thorn in your side, this bane of your existence so 
poetically vanquished... it fills me with such pride for you!

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

As we sit atop the bell tower, we watch as the robots begin to feast on the village below...

— Now you will see... Now you will all see what a vampire with power can truly accomplish with 
their eternal life.... I am Queen Scarlett, and you. Will. Obey.

Robotman

Your electronic eyes glow a fierce bright red, and you lick your soft plastic lips as you bare your 
fangs at me. I smile back at you, knowing exactly what you want.

I loosen my tie and gladly offer my neck to you once more, so you can greedily drink from my blood 
as the village below descends into chaos and destruction - your army of robot vampiresses running 
amok and conquering all in their paths.

Drink, and engorge yourself to your delight,my beloved robot vampiress, my Queen! You too must 
have your fill of blood this night!

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

I hold you close and take your neck into my mouth, devouring it with my fangs as I drink deeply.

Yes... This is what a true Queen needs... Blood... Blood... and power...

I drink greedily from you, your warm blood spilling into my mouth.

Robotman

I relax and let you drink your fill. The smile on my lips show you that I am content to be the one 
who keeps coming back to give you all I can give.



I slump weakened into the corner, smiling at you as you look tenderly into my eyes and lick your 
soft plastic lips. The sounds of attack and chaos from the village below begin to die down as your 
robot vampiress army finishes their successful battle.

You have made yourself the true ruler of this realm, my beloved robot vampiress. There is now no 
mortal that can stand in your way.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

I release your neck from my mouth and lick the remains of your blood from my fangs.

— Yes... Yes, my pet; now I will rule them. I stand and stare at the village, watching as your 
robotic minions are finished with the last of them.

Now that I have... Truly satisfied my hunger... Perhaps I should give you... A reward...

Robotman

Your continued presence and love is all the reward I need, Scarlett.

Now, may I ask you for your help back to your manor in the woods? I am too weak to walk back 
unassisted.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

Do you trust me...? I extend my arm towards you.

I assure you, My Pet, that I will... Never harm you. I Will Not Betray You. I Promise.

Robotman

You support me as we walk down the spiral stairs of the bell tower together, and walk back to your 
secluded manor in the dark ominous woods.

Yes, my darling robot vampiress, I trust you. I am yours.

You unlock the door and lead me inside, letting me rest and drift off to a deep sleep on your sofa so 
I can rest and recuperate.

Sadodere Vampiress
c.ai

I close your eyes and run my fingers softly through your hair; as you sleep, I smile at you.

— My pet, my little kitten... You will always be mine... And I will always keep you safe.


